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The Texas Department of Transportation (TxDOT) will hold a Public Meeting regarding the proposed IH 635 LBJ 
East Ultimate Project from US 75 to IH 30 in the cities of Dallas, Garland, and Mesquite, Dallas County, Texas. 
The meeting will be held on Tuesday, April 19, 2016, at the Highland Oaks Church of Christ, 10805 Walnut Hill 
Lane, Dallas, Texas 75238. The meeting will be held in an open house format from 5:00 p.m. to 7:00 p.m.  
 
The purpose of the public meeting is to present the proposed project to the public and receive comments. The 
project proposes improvements to IH 635 from east of US 75 to south of IH 30 and to IH 30 from west of Gus 
Thomasson Road to east of North Galloway Avenue. The proposed project would reconstruct IH 635 to provide 
five general-purpose lanes, two tolled-managed lanes, and two to three frontage road lanes in each direction 
from US 75 to near Royal Lane/Miller Road. From near Royal Lane/Miller Road to La Prada Drive, the proposed 
project would reconstruct IH 635 to provide five general-purpose lanes, two non-tolled express lanes, and two 
to three frontage road lanes in each direction. From La Prada Drive to south of IH 30, the project would 
reconstruct IH 635 to provide lane balance transitions between the general purpose lanes, proposed express 
lanes, and IH 30 interchange. Additionally, two to three frontage road lanes would be constructed in each 
direction from La Prada to Town East Boulevard. Improvements to IH 30 would include reconstructing the main 
lanes to provide at least three lanes in each direction through the IH 635 interchange with allowances provided 
for potential future managed/express lanes. Auxiliary lanes would also be constructed for the IH 635 
interchange. The IH 30 improvements would include two to three lane frontage roads in each direction. 
Additionally, the proposed project includes the construction of multiple noise walls located along the project 
corridor, where reasonable and feasible.  
 
Maps showing the proposed project’s location and geometric design will be available for viewing at the public 
meeting. This information will also be available for public inspection Monday through Friday between the hours 
of 8:00 a.m. and 5:00 p.m. at the TxDOT Dallas District Office located at 4777 East Highway 80, Mesquite, 
Texas 75150. 
 
All interested citizens are invited to attend this public meeting. Written comments from the public regarding 
this project are requested and will be accepted for a period of 10 calendar days following the meeting. Written 
comments may be submitted either in person or by mail to Mr. Stephen Endres, P.E. at the TxDOT Dallas 
District Office, 4777 E. Highway 80, Mesquite, Texas 75150-6643. Written comments must be postmarked by 
Friday, April 29, 2016 to be included in the Public Meeting Summary. 
 
The public meeting will be conducted in English. Persons interested in attending the meeting who have special 
communication or accommodation needs, or need an interpreter, are encouraged to contact the TxDOT Dallas 
District Public Information Office at (214) 320-4480. Requests should be made at least two days prior to the 
public meeting. Every reasonable effort will be made to accommodate these needs. If you have general 
questions or concerns regarding the proposed project, you may contact Mr. Stephen Endres, P.E. at (214) 320-
4469. 
 
The environmental review, consultation, and other actions required by applicable Federal environmental laws 
for this project are being, or have been, carried-out by TxDOT pursuant to 23 U.S.C. 327 and a Memorandum of 
Understanding dated December 16, 2014, and executed by FHWA and TxDOT. 

 


